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West Yorkshire & Harrogate Joint Committee of Clinical Commissioning Groups 
3 May 2022 
Action log 

 
 

Item Agenda Item Action by Deadline Status 

6th October 2020 

92/20 
 

Mental Health, Learning Disabilities 
and Autism – Commissioning of 
Assessment and Treatment Units 
Seek formal approval for the proposed 
approach to ATUs at a future meeting 
of the Joint Committee, once 
engagement has been completed. 

 
 

HH/KC 

 
 

6/04/21 

 
 
Closed:  Agreed at April 2021 
meeting. 

6th April 2021 
19/21 

 
White Paper: Integration and 
Innovation 
 
Schedule a progress report for a 
future meeting. 

 
 
 

SG 

 
 
 

6/07/21 

 
 
 
Closed:  Reported to July 2021 
meeting. 

92/20 
 

Mental Health, Learning Disabilities 
and Autism – Commissioning of 
Assessment and Treatment Units 
Seek formal approval for the proposed 
approach to ATUs at a future meeting 
of the Joint Committee, once 
engagement has been completed. 

 
 

HH/KC 

 
 

6/04/21 

 
 
Closed:  Agreed at April 2021 
meeting. 

5th October 2021 
38/21 

 
Integrated Care Board constitution 
– development and stakeholder 
involvement 
Seek approval from each CCG to 
proposed approach. 

 
 
 

SG 
 
 

 
 
 

09/11/21 

 
 
 
Closed:  All CCGs have 
approved approach.  
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